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Freemasonry is a fraternal organization that has existed for centuries. Its
members come from all walks of life, and they share a common belief in the
importance of brotherhood, charity, and truth.
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The origins of Freemasonry are shrouded in mystery, but it is believed that
the organization can be traced back to the ancient mystery schools of
Egypt and Greece. These schools were dedicated to the study of the
divine, and they taught their students how to live a life of virtue and
wisdom.

The ideals of the ancient mystery schools have been passed down through
the centuries, and they continue to be relevant to Freemasonry today.
These ideals include:
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The belief in a Supreme Being

The importance of living a moral life

The value of brotherhood and charity

The pursuit of knowledge and wisdom

These ideals are reflected in the rituals and ceremonies of Freemasonry.
For example, the Masonic lodge is a sacred space where members can
come together to learn about the divine and to live a life of virtue. The
rituals and ceremonies of Freemasonry are designed to help members
develop their moral character and to grow in wisdom and knowledge.

Freemasonry is a living tradition that has evolved over the centuries.
However, the ideals that inspired the ancient mystery schools continue to
be at the heart of the organization. These ideals are relevant to
Freemasonry today, and they will continue to be relevant for centuries to
come.

If you are interested in learning more about the ancient ideals that inspire
Freemasonry, then I encourage you to read Ancient Ideals In Modern
Masonry. This book explores the relationship between ancient ideals and
modern Freemasonry, and it provides a wealth of information about the
history and symbolism of the organization.

I believe that Ancient Ideals In Modern Masonry is an important book for
anyone who is interested in Freemasonry. It is a well-written and
informative book that provides a unique perspective on the organization. I
highly recommend this book to anyone who is interested in learning more
about Freemasonry.



Here are some additional details about the book:

Author: Manly P. Hall

Publisher: Theosophical University Press

Publication Date: 1927

: 0-8356-0541-8

You can Free Download Ancient Ideals In Modern Masonry from the
following retailers:

Our Book Library

Barnes & Noble

Theosophical University Press

I hope this article has been helpful. If you have any questions, please feel
free to leave a comment below.

Thank you for reading!
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